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Abstract  

This literature review meticulously explores the integration of Disaster Risk Reduction (DRR) 
techniques into sustainable tourism (SusT), placing a focal point on enhancing resilience 
and mitigating environmental impacts. By examining several disciplines, including tourism 
management, disaster management, environmental science, green innovation, and 



sustainable development, this study recognizes major themes, research gaps, and best 
practices in this emerging subject. It underlines the importance of SusT and the need for 
effective DRR programs to alleviate the negative effects of catastrophes on tourism 
destinations and ensure their long-term sustainability and resilience. Science Direct, 
Springer, SAGE Publications, and Wiley's online library were the selected databases and the 
inclusion criteria were based on studies that looked at how DRR measures were 
implemented in SusT practices and how effective they were in increasing resilience and 
lowering environmental effects. The selected literature reveals many concepts and ways for 
integrating DRR in tourism, such as pre-disaster planning, risk assessment, capacity 
building, and stakeholder involvement. The assessment identifies the vital part played by 
government agencies, local entities, and tourist service providers in organizing and 
coordinating these programs. It points out potential obstacles to DRR integration within the 
tourism sector. The review emphasizes the importance of monitoring and measuring the 
outcomes of DRR programs in tourism, and it suggests the use of metrics and indicators to 
assess how well resilience-building and environmental impact reduction strategies are 
implemented. These insights may be utilized by policymakers, academics, and practitioners 
to design methods that enhnace the resilience of tourism destinations while minimizing 
environmental consequences. 
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